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The 30-day girl was brought with the complaint of restless-
ness, decreased sucking, redness and swelling in the right 
breast. It was learned that the patient’s restlessness started 
a few days ago, her sucking decreased, redness appeared on 
her right breast two days ago, and her swelling has gradually 
increased. The patient had no fever. The examination revealed 
redness and warmness of the skin around the right breast, and 
fluctuating swelling about 2 cm in diameter. The patient was 
diagnosed with mastitis and breast abscess. Intravenous am-
picillin-sulbactam treatment was started. Gram-positive cocci 
was observed in the abscess drainage material, and Staphylo-
coccus aureus was isolated in culture. The same agent was also 
detected in the nasal swab cultures of the mother and baby, 
and both were given nasal topical mupirocin. In the follow-up, 
the patient’s mastitis findings regressed. The treatment was 
completed by giving ampicillin-sulbactam 10 days followed by 
oral amoxicillin-clavulanic acid for four days. 

Mastitis, an infection of the breast tissue, is rarely seen in new-
borns. It mostly occurs due to the rubbing or squeezing of 
physiological breast tissue hypertrophy by family members. 
This causes disruption of skin integrity and invasion of micro-
organisms into subcutaneous tissues in the breast area. Thus, 
mastitis and/or breast abscess develop. The most common 
clinical findings are swelling, redness, and warmness in the 

affected breast, rarely discharge from the nipple may be ob-
served. If mastitis turns into abscess, the fluctuating mass can 
be palpated. Ultrasonography may help differentiate mastitis 
from breast abscess and guide the treatment. The most com-
mon cause of neonatal mastitis is S. aureus. It is usually suffi-
cient to give antibiotic therapy for 10 to 14 days.
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